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Abstract 

The paper tackles the optimal manner of using corporate social responsibility in banking 

institutions to improve relations with stakeholders. Based on the previous literature, the 

paper explains how corporate social responsibility should be integrated in the marketing 

strategy of the bank, considering the relations of the banks with a wide range of stakeholders. 

The analysis emphasizes that it is important to integrate corporate social responsibility in 

the marketing plan in a structural manner, knowing that different types of stakeholders are 

sensitive to different behaviours of the bank in terms of sustainable actions undertaken.  
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1. Introduction

The banking system was largely considered to be the starting point of the financial
crisis started in 2008. After a long period of risk accumulation, partially enhanced 
by the credit expansion promoted by the banking system in the period 2005-2008, 
the financial crisis came with disastrous effects on the world economy and, of course, 
with a negative opinion of the general public on the banking system behaviour. 

 The beginning of the financial crises also highlighted the crucial role of the 
banking system in the economy. The states were obliged to use public financial aids 
to save the main banks in order to allow the economy to continue functioning. Even 
with these public measures, the financial crisis had important effects on the social 
well-being of the world population. 

The negative effects of the financial crisis on the image of banking institutions 
are often considered in the literature. In an attempt to improve their image among 
clients, but also among shareholders, potential investors, employees, communities, 
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etc., banks intensified their corporate social responsibility (CSR) actions. However, 
the manner of using corporate social responsibility as an instrument to improve the 
image of the bank in the relationship with different stakeholders was different and 
so was the efficiency of employing this instrument. 

Therefore, we considered important to show, based on the previous literature, 
how an efficient model of developing CSR practices can be promoted by its full 
integration in the marketing strategy of the bank. 

2. Problem Statement 

The research of corporate social responsibility in banks is a topic that gained 
importance in the last ten years. The analysis is made in different contexts, due to 
the complex and interdisciplinary character of corporate social responsibility and to 
its various effects on the bank image. The literature follows two important topics.  

On one hand, it tackles the role of corporate social responsibility in the 
relationship between banks and their investors. The results in this direction are 
complex. The general conclusions of Goss and Roberts (2011) explain that corporate 
social responsibility mitigates risks perceived by the creditors thus contributing to 
diminishing the cost of capital. El Ghoul et al. (2011) emphasize that corporate social 
responsibility contributes to mitigate risks, thus decreasing the cost of equity. These 
findings are completed with specific analyses on the banking system.  

Chen and Gavious (2015) show that shareholders react differently to corporate 
social initiatives, as minority shareholders value positively corporate social 
performance, while institutional investors and major shareholders are insensitive to 
these initiatives. Glossner (2019) brings useful insights by considering the 
investment horizon and highlights that shareholders with a long-run investment 
horizon are more concerned about CSR, but more in the sense of avoiding CSR 
concerns and the incumbent risk than of enhancing CSR strengths of the banks. 

Bae et al. (2018) find a non-linear correlation between banks’ corporate social 
performance and the cost of debt, with a mitigating effect of the former on the cost 
of debt. However, to a limited extent, the decrease in the financing cost is lower for 
more intense implication of the banks in corporate social responsibility. 

The other main stream of literature is regarding how corporate social 
responsibility actions undertaken by banking institutions in different countries are 
perceived by customers and influence banks’ image. The literature in this regard is 
mainly formed of empirical studies based on interviews with samples of clients on 
particular aspects and on specific national environments, providing sparse 
conclusions on the subject. However, some general lines are as follows. 

Corporate social responsibility is able to have a positive contribution on the brand 
image and bank reputation. Landrum (2017) published a survey that mentions that 
more than half of the population interviewed would pay more for products from 
CSR-performing companies and the trend is more accentuated among young people. 
Also, Fatma and Rahman (2016) for the Indian banking system, Cowan and Guzman 
(2020), Lecuyer et al. (in press), Polychronidou et al. (2014) and Xie, Bagozzi and 
Gronhang (2019) show that corporate social responsibility improves brand image. 
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However, the literature also identifies mitigating factors such as religious beliefs 
(Ramasamy et al., 2013), gender (Calabrese, Costa and Rosati, 2016), emotions, 
attitudes and moral values (Chen and Huang, 2016; Xie, Bagozzi and Gronhang, 
2019) or national characteristics such as the law system (Demirbag et al., 2017). 
From a different perspective, Millon-Cornett et al. (2016), based on an empirical 
analysis of the U.S. banks demonstrate that these institutions include corporate social 
responsibility in their instruments used for improving their image seriously affected 
by the 2008 financial crisis. 

The literature also explains that the efficiency of different types of actions 
included in the field of corporate social responsibility varies, with more altruistic 
ones being valued more (Perez and Rodriguez del Bosque, 2015; Chen and Huang, 
2016). Goyal and Chanda (2017) demonstrate that community and environment-
focussed CSR actions are positively related to customer loyalty, and community and 
customer directed ones are correlated with customer recommendation. Rivera et al. 
(2016) conclude that training and environmental CSR actions are positively 
correlated with customer satisfaction.  

Other studies analyse how corporate social responsibility is employed in the 
relationship of banks with other stakeholders. Korshun, Bhattacharya and Sen 
(2009), Prior, Surroca and Tribo (2008), Benitez et al. (2020) or Tourky, Kitchen 
and Shoalan (in press) among others analyse how corporate social responsibility 
influence the relation of banks with their employees. Other categories of 
stakeholders considered from this perspective are suppliers (Govindan et al., 2018) 
and communities (Goyal, 2006). 

The effectiveness of different types of CSR actions in the relation with specific 
types of shareholders and the complex interaction of corporate social responsibility 
with the brand image and customer loyalty makes necessary the integration of banks’ 
policy in terms of CSR in the marketing strategy of the banks. The existing literature 
supports this idea (Ranangen, 2015). 

3. Research Questions/Aims of the Research 

The complex mechanism through which corporate social responsibility 
influences brand image and the relationship of the bank with a wide range of 
shareholders, as demonstrated in the literature, imposes the integration of the 
corporate social responsibility policy of the bank in its marketing strategy. 

The present paper presents the main particularities of the marketing strategy in 
banking institutions and explains how and why it should integrate corporate social 
responsibility in a coherent manner. 

4. Research Methods 

The paper uses the analysis of the previous literature as a basis for the 
recommendations regarding the optimal design of a marketing strategy for banks that 
integrate corporate social responsibility. The professional analytic inference based 
on secondary data investigation is used in a structured process built upon a classic 
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economic model specific to banking marketing (Olteanu, 2005) to describe the 
optimal manner of incorporating CSR policy in the marketing strategy coherently to 
the objectives of the bank. 

5. Findings 

According to Bhattacharya, Daniel and Sen (2009) the motivations that drive the 
buying decisions are related to functional benefits of the good offered or to the fact 
that buying the good makes customers feel better and corresponds to their moral 
values. Banks can use corporate social responsibility in relation with the second 
group of motivations and, therefore, integrate it in the marketing activity. 

There are two major paths of action for including corporate social responsibility 
in the design of marketing strategy in banks.  

The first one consists in designing dedicated programs targeting the brand image. 
Corporate social responsibility can thus become an instrument to consolidate the 
image of the corporation in the eyes of clients and other stakeholders. One should 
keep in mind that in the banking industry, characterized by a generally high level of 
homogeneity in the services offered, corporate image is primarily targeted, the 
service brand being significantly less powerful in stakeholders’ cognition (see 
Olteanu, 2005).  

As a consequence of the high homogeneity of the financial services provided by 
banks, the marketing department has as permanent concern to individualize the 
service offered according to clients’ expectations. If from a technical point of view, 
the means of personalizing the services offered are limited, one possible way to 
achieve this goal is to attach them some attributes related to adapting to customers’ 
moral goals and concerns. By considering corporate social responsibility in the 
design of the banking services, financial institutions address primarily a special 
category of clients, respectively the caring consumers, segment which recorded a 
spectacular increase in the last decade and remains on an ascending trend. The 
integration of corporate social responsibility in the design of the banking services 
can be done either in the core product or in the auxiliary elements related to the 
financial services provided. An example for the first case can be the development of 
dedicated products directed towards environmental protection, such as the issuance 
of green bonds for financing complex environmental protection programs 
implemented by private actors or the green mortgages, instrument implemented by 
several banks in Romania for encouraging the development of green residential 
projects, but in the meantime to respond to particular segments of clientele concerned 
with minimizing their environmental impact. In the second case, the consideration 
of corporate social responsibility is not related to the characteristics of the core 
product, but with how it is provided for the client. The bank can choose specific ways 
to deliver it (for example online or through other electronic devices, instead of the 
classical written form), using recycled materials in the activity of the bank 
employees, developing special department for assisting clients at distance or 
manifesting a constant concern for minimizing the quantity of natural resources used 
in the daily activity by the banks. One widely recorded trend in the banking sector is 
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the choice of certified green buildings for their agencies or meeting points with their 
clients and stakeholders, as a statement of their preoccupation for environment and 
community. Another form of auxiliar attributes related to corporate social 
responsibility attached to the financial services that can be valued by clients and 
stakeholders are the informational attributes, generally contributing to financial 
education or environmental concern awareness. 

In terms of marketing process levels, considering that the auxiliary attributes of 
the financial services appear in the direct interaction of the consumers with the 
employees of the banking institution, within agencies or virtually, the corporate 
social responsibility should be implemented both in the general level of the bank 
process level and in the functional one. The general level refers to the design of the 
marketing process in the bank headquarters and provides those general conceptual 
attributes of the financial service that are identical in all agencies and instances where 
the service is provided. The functional level encompasses the particular features of 
the service intimately related to its provision, which can differ from one agency to 
another or in time.  

The analysis of how corporate social responsibility may be implemented in the 
marketing strategy can also be made according to what phase of the marketing 
process (Olteanu, 2005) is concerned with including corporate social responsibility 
elements. Though specific CSR elements can be implemented throughout all phases, 
there are several particularities related to each phase. 

The market-oriented strategic planning provides the opportunity to integrate CSR 
especially in defining the mission of the bank and to a lesser extent in the decisions 
related to the operation domains and to identifying strategic activity units.  

The integration of the corporate social responsibility in the strategic planning 
phase is merely indirect, throughout its potential influences on the generic strategy 
designed for specific operation domains. The main generic strategies put in evidence 
by Porter (1985) are the following: the cost domination, the differentiation and the 
focus. Coherent choices in terms of corporate social responsibility can be identified 
for each generic strategy, but they are different. In the cost domination strategy, the 
choices in terms of CSR must be those that converge with the general objective of 
cost minimization, for instance implementing electronic exchanges of information 
instead of the written one. In the differentiation strategy, educational or social goals, 
as well as clearly defined environmental projects can be attached to the service 
provided. In the focus strategy, those CSR goals clearly associated to the moral 
values and goals of the clientele segment targeted need to be considered, the others 
being usually avoided due to their weak power of penetration in the market niche.  

The Strategic marketing planning phase offers the possibility to consider how 
corporate social responsibility can be used in the service design and how it impacts 
on the decisions related to the marketing mix components. For example, in making 
the strategic planning of the financial service provision, corporate social 
responsibility is to be considered at functional level, in the auxiliary attributes that 
concern the delivery of the main financial services. In the same vein, in the strategic 
planning of the promotion policy at a general level, the corporate social 
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responsibility can be embedded in the design of the promotional activity in such way 
as to encompass the concerns of the targeted segment of clients in terms of message, 
communication channel, informational content etc. 

The mission of the company is clearly the focal point where corporate social 
responsibility should be implemented for insuring an efficient integration of this 
powerful tool in a successful bank marketing strategy. According to Payne (1993), 
the mission of the company must describe the corporate goal in a long-run 
perspective, the principles, values, beliefs and aspirations encompassed in the 
corporate culture and then transposed into corporate actions. If the bank manages to 
incorporate corporate social responsibility correctly in the corporate mission, then 
the bases for an efficient corporate social responsibility policy in improving 
corporate image are created. 

The integration of corporate social responsibility in the choice of the marketing 
instruments has also some particularities. It is also important to insure and adapt the 
use of marketing instruments in order to ensure the coherence with the corporate 
social responsibility goals assumed. Hence, in the segmentation, considering 
corporate social responsibility may require conducting a market research able to 
identify the caring consumers and their relative value. Then, the product or corporate 
strategy should use these finding to assess the correct weight and type of the 
corporate social responsibility activity, knowing that, according to Beasley and 
Ghatak (2007), their success depends on the importance of the caring consumers 
segment in the volume of the potential market and on the institutional features of the 
economic environment. 

In the positioning decisions, corporate social responsibility can be one important 
form of product or company differentiation as documented on a sample of Nepalese 
banks in Upadhaya, Munir, Blount and Su (2018). 

The coherence of corporate social responsibility with the marketing mix is also 
important. In terms of product design, as seen before, responsible goals can be 
integrated in the core product that can be specifically oriented towards caring 
consumer segments (green mortgages, for example), or in auxiliary attributes of 
some services addressed to a large mass of consumers (see for example, the cause-
related marketing). The decisions related to the promotion of the product or service 
can be impacted to a bigger or a lesser extent by corporate social responsibility 
according to the sensitivity of the target segment of clients to the responsible actions 
of the bank. The decisions regarding the distribution of the service, including the 
distribution channels, the adequation of the distribution place etc., give the best 
results when they are designed to be coherent to the corporate social responsibility 
goals assumed by the banking institution. Even in terms of price policy, corporate 
social responsibility should be considered, especially if we consider that, at least for 
certain segments of clientele, the association of the financial service to a certain 
corporate responsible action can diminish the elasticity of the demand to price 
increases. 

Also, one must consider the wider perspective of the relationship marketing. In 
this vein, the effect of corporate social responsibility on the relationship of the bank 
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with the other stakeholders is very important. Ranangen (2015) emphasize the need 
to consider corporate social responsibility when designing the management system 
of the relationship of the bank with the entire range of stakeholders.  

6. Conclusions 

The paper provides some considerations on how corporate social responsibility 
can be used as a financial-banking marketing instrument. Based on the study of the 
literature on how corporate social responsibility influences the bank relations with 
stakeholders, we explain in a theoretical approach how corporate social 
responsibility should be integrated in the marketing strategy of banks for optimal 
outcomes. 

The literature on corporate social responsibility demonstrates that it affects 
corporate image and the relation with stakeholders. However, the state of the art 
regarding how it should be used as instrument of the relationship marketing reveals 
a sparse image, the studies published so far being focused generally on narrow 
research questions. Therefore, an effort of contributing to the structuring of the 
specialty literature in the field is useful. This paper represents an attempt of offering 
a synthesis of the conclusions of the specialty literature regarding the relationship 
between financial-banking marketing and the corporate social responsibility. It then 
puts forward considerations about how corporate social responsibility policy should 
be integrated in the marketing strategy of banks starting from the planning phase, to 
ensure the necessary coherence with the objectives of the corporation in terms of 
relationship marketing. 

The paper puts in evidence that corporate social responsibility should be 
integrated in all phases of the marketing strategy, in a manner coherent with the 
particularities of the financial products and in the relationship with different types of 
stakeholders, knowing that different categories of corporate social responsibility 
actions have different efficiency in relation with specific stakeholders and 
considering different mitigating factors. 

As a bottom point, in the present economic conditions characterized by a strong 
competition, corporate social responsibility cannot be ignored in the banking 
activity. Its integration in the marketing strategy of the banking institution in a 
comprehensive and coherent way, represents the necessary condition for obtaining 
the best results in terms of corporate image and stakeholders’ loyalty. 
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